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Public Policy and Government Affairs Advocate Olivia Pantoja  
Joins Faegre Drinker Consulting in Chicago 

  
Chicago — August 8, 2023 — Faegre Drinker announced today that Olivia Pantoja has 
joined the firm as senior director with Faegre Drinker Consulting in the Chicago office. 
She joins the firm from OMP Strategy & Advocacy Group, LLC, where she served as 
President. 
 
Leading clients through advocacy and strategy efforts, Pantoja serves organizations in a 
range of industries with their most complex issues. With a long-standing history of 
representing professional and trade associations, she often incorporates her 
relationships with industry leaders in her work at all levels of government. 
 
Pantoja has partnered with organizations in hospitality, health care, nonprofits, sports 
teams and more on initiatives including criminal justice reform, supplier diversity, 
procurement and environmental matters. 
 
“Olivia’s experience in identifying issues and policies of impact, along with her ability to 
engage diverse stakeholders, will be greatly valuable to our clients and the firm,” said 
Murray Clark, leader of the firm’s state and local policy, advocacy and consulting team. 
“We are excited to welcome Olivia and her collaborative spirit to our consulting team.” 
 
Pantoja has served as a government relations consultant at all levels, including federal, 
multi-state, Cook County and the City of Chicago. In addition to her extensive 
experience representing restaurant groups, health care associations and other 
industries, she has also served as an adjunct faculty member at National Louis 
University.  
 
As a member of the Latino Leadership Council board, Olivia is proud to bring the 
perspective of a historically underrepresented group to her work at the national level. 
She co-founded The Maverick Movement, a non-profit that is committed to improving 
the quality of life in her hometown of Lordsburg, New Mexico.  
 
Pantoja earned her bachelor’s and master’s degrees from National Louis University. 
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Faegre Drinker Consulting team members provide advisory and advocacy services at 
the intersection of government and the private sector at both the federal and state 
levels. Consultants serve clients in key industries such as health and biosciences, 
energy and environment, economic development, financial services, food and 
agribusiness, media and technology, and technology and privacy — impacting public 
policy, regulation and procurement to grow businesses and serve missions.   

  
About Faegre Drinker   

Faegre Drinker is a firm designed for clients. With 1,200 experienced attorneys and 
consulting professionals licensed in nearly every state in the U.S., and with strategic 
offices in London and Shanghai, we have the strength and reach to solve our clients’ 
most complex transactional, litigation and regulatory challenges, wherever they may 
arise. Faegre Drinker Consulting, the firm’s advisory and advocacy division based in 
Washington, D.C., provides public policy, regulatory and technical services to key 
sectors of the economy. Additional services include Tritura Information Governance, the 
firm’s data science subsidiary, and Innovative Health Strategies, a health care 
consultancy that helps hospitals operate efficiently and improve quality of service. Learn 
more at FaegreDrinker.com. 
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