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Faegre Drinker Strengthens Indiana Government Relations and Advocacy Team 
With Counsel Lacey Berkshire and Senior Director Maddie Augustus  

 
Indianapolis — July 30, 2024 — Faegre Drinker announced today that counsel Lacey 
Berkshire and senior director Maddie Augustus have joined the firm’s government and 
regulatory group in Indianapolis. Their addition continues the growing strength of the 
Indiana government relations and advocacy team which welcomed counsel Mindy 
Westrick Brown who rejoined the firm last year. 
 
Berkshire brings a broad skillset and a multidisciplined practice advocating for clients 
before the Indiana General Assembly and executive branch agencies. She helps large 
corporations, small businesses, trade associations and other entities navigate 
governmental processes and procedures, and advises companies on public sector 
procurement and growth strategies. She has a breadth of experience across many 
complex policy areas, including healthcare, energy, insurance, local government, 
controlled substances, and gaming, among others. 
 
Augustus is a registered lobbyist with a robust network of government officials and 
policy makers and works to collaborate with a diverse array of clients ranging from 
corporations to nonprofits. Her experience spans legislative branch lobbying, executive 
branch consulting and procurement strategies, and she regularly leads stakeholder 
meetings aimed at informing and bringing together clients and government officials.  
 
“Respected throughout the halls of state government, Lacey and Maddie are true 
professionals and trusted advisors, with a keen understanding of how to navigate 
complex policy proposals,” said Murray Clark, leader of the firm’s state and local policy, 
advocacy and consulting team. “Their impressive track record in building consensus 
and implementing public policy strategy will have a great impact on our efforts as we 
look to advocate for our clients in the Statehouse, and we’re thrilled to bring them to the 
team.” 
 
Berkshire’s prior experience includes practicing government affairs and regulatory law at 
a national law firm, serving as the director of health plans at the Insurance Institute of 
Indiana, serving as Legislative Counsel for the Indiana Prosecuting Attorneys Council 
and lobbying on behalf of the Indiana Credit Union League as the Director of Advocacy. 
She earned a bachelor’s degree from DePauw University, a master’s degree in public 
affairs from Indiana University Indianapolis and her Juris Doctor from Indiana University 
Robert H. McKinney School of Law.  
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Augustus prior experience includes serving as director of government relations at the 
Insurance Institute of Indiana. She earned her bachelor’s degree in political science and 
a graduate certificate in nonprofit, public and organizational management at Indiana 
University-Purdue University Indianapolis. 
 
Faegre Drinker's Indiana state relations team dates back to 1863. The team offers a 
wide range of government services, leveraging the backgrounds and government 
experience of each team member to deliver messages and develop strategies that help 
businesses, organizations and community move forward. 
 
About Faegre Drinker  
Faegre Drinker is a firm designed for clients. With 1,200 experienced attorneys and 
consulting professionals licensed in nearly every state in the U.S., and with strategic 
offices in London and Shanghai, we have the strength and reach to solve our clients’ 
most complex transactional, litigation and regulatory challenges, wherever they may 
arise. Faegre Drinker Consulting, the firm’s advisory and advocacy division based in 
Washington, D.C., provides public policy, regulatory and technical services to key 
sectors of the economy. Additional services include Tritura Information Governance, the 
firm’s data science subsidiary, and Innovative Health Strategies, a health care 
consultancy that helps hospitals operate efficiently and improve quality of service. Learn 
more at FaegreDrinker.com. 
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